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Abstract. This paper provides a typology of organisational changes, i.e., changes of structure, culture, strategy, 
human resources, technologies and system. Leaders of organisations, teams of employees and even external 
consultants participate in organisational change process and take on roles and responsibility for change. It is 
revealed by analyzing such roles as initiators, agents, facilitators and catalysts of organisational change. The 
empirical analysis is based on 306 representatives from different organisations who stated that they get change-
related information from their executives through traditional and non-traditional means that allow to change 
organisational culture, to develope human resources, to manage processes and changes competently. 
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1. Introduction 

Organisational changes are fuelled by various 
global economic, political, social, ecological and 
technological changes. In the recent years scholarly 
publications deal with changes in organisational 
environment (Karlowski, Paslawski 2008), changes 
related to competition (Snieska, Draksaite 2007) 
and nature of labour (Jurkstiene et al. 2008; Kum-
pikaite, Ciarniene 2008); globalisation (Ogrean et 
al. 2008); internationalisation (Vida, Obadia 2008); 
integration processes (Melnikas, 2008); economic-
social development (Ginevicius, Podvezko 2009); 
development of knowledge economy (Chen 2008); 
circulation of brainpower (Daugeliene, Marcinke-
viciene 2009). As changes in various elements of 
external organisational environment occur, man-
agement is increasingly more often seen as im-
provement of organisation and its people, govern-
ment of speed-up of processes and development 
(Weiner, Brown 2006). As processes get faster, 
rapid multiplication and fusion of methods, prod-
ucts, services, and systems take place, which leads 
to survival of those that have best adapted them-
selves. Therefore, according to Drucker (2007), a 
way to survive the period of rapid structural 
changes is through becoming a leader of changes: it 
is necessary to implement policies of change by 
rejecting the past, organising improvement and de-
velopment, taking advantage of success, introduc-
ing innovations and taking up challenges. 

Although in scientific publications a rather 
substantial attention is paid to issues of implementa-
tion of organisational changes (Alas 2008; Jump-

ponen et al. 2008; Rees et al. 2008), linkages be-
tween managers’ communicative competences and 
organisational changes success are analysed (Pun-
dziene et al. 2007), however, organizational change 
communication is little studied explicitly (Frahm, 
Brown 2007); researchers do not seem to be paying 
adequate attention to problems regarding typology 
of changes in analysis of psychosemantic structures 
of employees of various organisations, responsibil-
ity for changes and communication of changes. 

Scientific problem of this research is put in 
problem-based questions requiring empirical re-
search: What is the expressed opinion of employ-
ees of organisation on the necessary organisational 
changes? What is the expressed opinion of respon-
dents on subjects responsible for changes? What is 
the expressed opinion of respondents on the com-
munication of changes within organisations? 

Research object is expressed opinion of em-
ployees on the typology of changes, responsibility 
for changes, and communication of changes. 

Research aim is to analyse psychosemantics 
of employees’ opinion in aspects of manifestation 
of typology of changes, responsibility for changes, 
and communication of changes. 

Research objectives are: to analyse scientific 
literature on typology of changes, responsibility 
for changes, and communication of changes; to 
empirically analyse the attitudes of members of 
organisation on typology of changes, subjects re-
sponsible for changes, subjects communicating 
changes, and communication channels they use. 
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Research methods are scientific literature a-
nalysis, qualitative and quantitative content analy-
sis, statistical processing of data. 

2. Theoretical background 

2.1. Typology of organisational changes  
(dimensions/areas/features/forms) 

It has been proven scientifically that organisations 
or their elements can be changed. Traditionally the 
following elements of an organisation are consid-
ered to be the most important: human resources,  
 

culture, structure, strategy, and technology (Bartol, 
Martin 1991; Karpavicius et al. 2007). If any of 
these elements changes, the entire organisation 
changes as well. However, changing structure or 
strategy does not ensure productive changes in an 
organisation. According to Waterman et al. 
(2001), an efficient change in an organisation must 
include the following elements: structure, strategy, 
systems and procedures, style, skills, personnel, 
and the so-called “superordinate goals”. Therefore 
it is very important to know the main aim of an 
organisation and also what has not been done yet. 
 

 
Fig.1. Typology of organisational changes (Source: compiled by the authors of the article with reference to Bartol, 
Martin (1991), Gelinas, James (1997), Wyman (1998), Waterman et al. (2001), Zakarevicius (2003), Daft (2004), 
Karpavicius et al. (2007)). 
 

As seen in Figure 1, the content of organisa-
tional changes is very broad. There are changes in 
structure of management, organisation, staff, and 
management culture, the strategy is replaced or 
redefined, there occur changes in human resources 
management process related to increase in per-
formance and efficiency as well as to development 
of skills and competences, reform of organisa-
tional environment takes place, new technologies 
are used for products, production or in business 
processes, there are systematic changes as well. 
According to Cetkovic, Knezevic (2006), this 
change is related to reformation of the core organ-
isational agreements, objectives, operations, and 
results, also to revision of business image and so-
cial environment in general. 

Lithuanian scientific literature (Zakarevicius 
2003) focuses on methods of and ways for man-
agement of individual elements of an organisation: 
adjustment of strategy, reformation of organisa-

tional forms and structures, transformation of or-
ganisation’s operation processes, improvement of 
staff management, development of motivational 
mix, and modification of organisational culture. 

According to Lipinskiene, Stokaite (2006), 
changes taking place at an organisation are as-
sessed using such indicators as introduction of 
innovations, new principles of organization of 
production of goods and services, marketing sys-
tems, financial relations and the like, increase in 
amount of information, intensification of conflicts 
and stresses, structural changes, personnel policy 
and new value orientations and changed expecta-
tions of employees, changes in organisational 
aims, objectives, and mission. 

Implementation of changes at an organisation 
yields the following outcomes: strategic combina-
tions – mergers, acquisitions, joint ventures; col-
lapses, separations, sales; reductions; expansion to 
new locations, markets, technologies, and offer-

 

Structure 

 

Culture 
 

 

Strategy 

 

Human resources 

 

Technologies 

 

Systems 

Complex 
changes 

Organisational anatomy: distribution of re-
sources, decentralisation, etc. 

Organisational soul: values, customer focus, 
style, information management, etc. 

Main aims, expansion, reductions, strategic 
combinations, etc. 

Skills, motivational mix, programs for quality, 
etc. 

Organisational processes, operational environ-
ment, etc. 

Operations management system, etc. 



PSYCHOSEMANTICS OF EMPLOYEE’S IMAGES WHEN IDENTIFYING A TYPOLOGY, RESPONSIBILITY AND 
COMMUNICATION OF ORGANISATIONAL CHANGES  

1025 

ings; new leadership (Wyman 1998); horizontal 
arrangement, teams, products, mergers, joint ven-
tures, consortiums, networks, new technologies, 
new business processes (Daft 2004); e-business 
(Jovarauskiene, Pilinkiene 2009); learning organi-
sation (Sakalas, Venskus 2007); organisational 
learning (Hernaus et al. 2008); introduction of 
innovations at workplaces (Reinhold et al. 2008). 

2.2. Aspect of responsibility for organisational 
changes 

According to Andrews et al. (2008), contemporary 
process of organisational changes involves not 
only top or middle management, but also teams of 
employees and independent advisers. All these 
participants have different experience and pros-
pects. External advisers become necessary when 
big changes are being implemented or when or-
ganisation’s members (managers and executives) 
lack objective attitude, need advice and help. 
However, external advisers do not have sufficient 
understanding of the organisation’s history, cul-
ture, work procedures, and personnel (Robbins 
2006). Furthermore, they may offer more drastic 
changes, because they will not have to endure the 
outcomes of these changes themselves. Meanwhile 
managers and employees of the organisation are 
more cautious and attentive when implementing 
changes. 

Organisation’s members (or even external ad-
visers) may take different roles in managing or-
ganisational changes. The differences here are in 
responsibility and involvement in the process of 
change. The initiator of changes is considered a 
person who has proposed to make some change for 
the organisation that experiences difficulties or is 
in crisis situation. Major efforts in organising and 
coordinating changes must be put by the change 
agent that may be an independent adviser, a group 
of employees, or the manager of the organisation 
(for example, seeking to ensure smooth process of 
changes). Struggler for changes has enthusiasm to 
change, i.e., to remind everyone why the changes 
take place and what benefit they will bring. The 
latter two roles (change agent and struggler for 
changes) may be served by the same person, only 
at different time. Supporter of changes is formally 
responsible for coordination of the process of 
changes. It can be one of the departments of the 
organisation (such as Human Resources Depart-
ment or Strategic Planning Department), or a few 
managers (particularly in smaller organisations) 
supervising keeping to schedule and timely provi-
sion of resources as well as proceeding of training 
(Major Roles during... 2010). 

Changes require management; therefore it is 
necessary to take responsibility for the change. 
This responsibility falls on one person (e.g., a team 
leader) or a group of specialists. Such people be-
come the agents of changes, and external advisers 
often serve the role of catalysts of changes (Cald-
well 2003 cited by Burnes 2004). Leading em-
ployees or “leaders of opinion” who think entre-
preneurially and have innovative management 
skills are called agents of changes, and catalysts of 
changes significantly contribute to employees’ 
reflection on their activities (Dover 2003). This 
requires to be respected by colleagues, to clearly 
formulate vision, aims, strategy, continuously up-
date and transfer cultural values to all employees. 
At the team level a change agent serves the formal 
or informal role of a leader, guides the team in the 
right direction. 

A change agent can be the organisation’s de-
velopment specialist, division leader, or mid-level 
manager responsible for changes in own area of 
activity. According to Tearle (2009) any person 
becomes a change agent when a team or the entire 
organisation seeks something new. Complexity and 
multi-stage character of changes means that they 
cannot be delegated to a few experts or managers – 
everyone at an organisation must be responsible for 
changes. However, Perme (1999) distinguishes a 
change agent from other employees as the one as-
suming responsibility for self-change and care of 
co-workers. According to this researcher, a true 
change agent fully understands the situation as well 
as how he could influence it. He is a qualified spe-
cialist happy with his status, sure about his values, 
motivated, skilled, and able to build coalitions and 
ask for help. Such a person is ready to make com-
promises to open a way for greater aims. Further-
more, he is energetic, reaching consensus, building 
trust, and seeking dialogue. 

Burnes (2004) identifies different models of 
agents of changes. By model of leadership, agents 
of changes are top level managers responsible for 
identification and presentation of strategic/trans-
formational changes. By model of management, 
agents of changes are mid-level managers / func-
tional specialists responsible for introduction or 
support of specific elements of strategic change 
programmes or projects. By model of consulting, 
agents of changes are external or internal advisers 
that may be invited to work at any level. By model 
of teams, agents of changes are teams operating at 
different levels of organisation and made up of 
managers, employees, and advisers who are neces-
sary for implementation of a specific project of 
changes delegated to them. 

http://www.transformations.khf.vu.lt/14/contri/thernaus.html
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According to Weick, Quinn (1999), the con-
tent of roles of a change agent also depends on 
whether the changes that take place at the organi-
sation are temporal or permanent. Temporal 
changes require from a change agent creativity, 
alternative decisions, new interpretation of factors, 
good coordination, and commitment. Moreover, as 
permanent changes take place a change agent must 
give sense to them, properly guide them, apply 
current trends, not to interfere with improvising 
and learning. 

Therefore a change agent can be characterised 
as reliable, aware, enthusiastic, flexible, possess-
ing good communication skills, able to change 
attitude, informing others about benefit of changes 
for people and in resolving problems, including 
others when talking, and leading by own example 
(Change Agents: The... 2010); facilitating the 
process of changes, identifying and analysing fac-
tors affecting changes and managing them if pos-
sible (Carney 2000). According to Lines (2007), a 
change agent can be described as an individual 
especially responsible for planning, implementa-
tion, and outcomes of strategic changes. He is dis-
tinguished from others by power and motivation. 
Zubialde (2001) emphasizes striving to understand 
an individual or a community where he acts during 
changes, as well as application of knowledge by 
setting uniting aims, consolidating the most appro-
priate and accessible resources, technologies, and 
information for the desired changes to be achie-
ved. According to Brantly (2007), a change agent 
is responsible for successful start of organisational 
changes; may (or may not) be empowered to start 
changes, but is responsible for results; needs ongo-
ing support from management and employees; 
must be able to communicate at all levels, estab-
lish and maintain positive relations with parties 
being influenced, understand and adapt to ever 
changing and clashing priorities. 

2.3. Communication of changes 

In order to prepare the staff for changes and per-
suade they are necessary, a change agent must 
familiarize all the employees with causes, proceed-
ing, and outcomes of changes. In implementing 
organisational changes it is important to support 
the organisation’s members so that they adapt to 
innovations, gain missing knowledge, and acquire 

resources needed. First of all, according to Bartke-
viciute (2008), employees must be duly supplied 
with information helping to comprehend the 
causes and extent of the planned changes, which 
should prevent origination of rumours and unrea-
sonable discussions. So, effective communication 
is one of the key success factors in the change 
process (Linke, Zerfass 2011).  

There are no “bad” means of communication. 
However, some of the persons responsible for 
changes use them wrongly or inefficiently. Ac-
cording to Davis (2000), changes can be commu-
nicated differently, but it is important to choose an 
appropriate channel for communication (Fig. 2). 
For example, email is used to quickly share de-
tailed information. Intranet is used for independent 
search for employees thus satisfying own interests, 
bulletins and posters are for notifications and vis-
ual reinforcement of an idea. Video recording 
helps to depict or illustrate an idea, while tele- or 
videoconferencing is good for reviewing, answer-
ing questions, and discussing concepts. Face-to-
face conversations take place when discussing 
changes. According to Russ (2008), informal sup-
plements at an organisation are informational 
meetings of small groups as well as interpersonal 
verbal communication on changes. 

Analysing activity of greatly communicating 
managers Kotter (2007) notes that they generate 
various notices. At casual discussions on business 
problems they speak of whether the solutions pro-
posed are suitable in broader context. At regular 
assessments of activities they talk about how em-
ployee behaviour facilitates or hampers vision. 
Quarterly review of departmental activity includes 
not only the numbers, but also how managers of 
departments contribute to transformation. 

Answering the questions frequently asked by 
employees, managers link their answers to the 
revised aims. Successfully implementing changes, 
managers use all the available communication 
channels for dissemination of the vision. Boring 
and often ignored organisation’s bulletins are 
turned into funny articles on vision, quarterly 
meetings of management are replaced by interest-
ing discussions on transformation, and general 
training at organisation are converted into courses 
on business problems and the new vision. 
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Fig.2. Richness of communication channel (Source: modified by the authors of the article with reference to Commu-
nication on Agile Software Projects). 
 

Jimmieson et al. (2008) say that persuasive 
communication, information provision, informa-
tional bulletins, face-to-face communication, dis-
cussions, observation are the most effective ways to 
promote new beliefs or change current attitudes. By 
providing information to employees on what behav-
iour is favourable for changes, what the possible 
results of changes are, by introducing opportunities 
for participation, having identified employees’ ex-
pectations, potential support and obstacles to 
changes, the change agents can help to strengthen 
readiness to support initiatives of changes. 

In addition to traditional means of communica-
tion (such as bulletins issued by trade unions) and 
vertical direct communication (Bernerth 2004), new 
means (Wiki, blog, RSS-feeds, podcast, Skype, etc.) 
are used increasingly more often. 

3. Research methodology 

Anonymous semi-open-ended questionnaire in-
tended for employees of both business and public 
sector organisations was chosen as the primary 
research method. 306 representatives of organisa-
tions investigated participated in the survey. The 
questions for the questionnaire were selected so 
that they cover employees’ opinions on typology 
of organisational changes, responsibility for organ-
isational changes, and communication about them. 
This article presents the third part of our research 
carried out in October-December of 2008. The 
first part of the research was published in Issue 5 
(65) of the journal “Engineering Economics” in 
2009, the second part – in Issue 3 (17) of the jour-
nal “Social Research” in 2009 (Saparnis et al. 

2009 a,b). The first publication is dedicated to 
analysis of planning of changes, resistance to 
changes, and overcoming of resistance to changes. 
The second publication deals the aspects of identi-
fication of changes and dimensions of a successful 
organisation. Moreover, these publications also 
overview the corresponding aspects of the results 
of the empirical research. 

In order to identify the typology of organisa-
tional changes we referred to the results of re-
searches presented by Bartol, Martin (1991), Geli-
nas, James (1997), Wyman (1998), Waterman et al. 
(2001), Zakarevicius (2003), Daft (2004), Kar-
pavicius et al. (2007); when analysing responsibility 
for and communication of organisational changes 
we referred to Perme (1999); Weick, Quinn (1999); 
Carney (2000); Zubialde (2001); Dover (2003); 
Burnes (2004); Robbins (2006); Brantly (2007); 
Lines (2007); Andrews et al. (2008), and other. The 
main sources for analysis of the aspect of commu-
nication of changes were the publications by Davis 
(2000); Bernerth (2004); Kotter (2007); Bartkevici-
ute (2008); Jimmieson et al. (2008); Russ (2008). 
Meanwhile categorisation of the research results 
draws on subjective opinion and competences of the 
authors of the article. 

A rather substantial role in interpreting the data 
of the research has been played by a branch of psy-
chology called psychosematics. It analyses, inter 
alia, what subjective meanings the individuals and 
social groups tend to assign to verbal stimuli. 
Speech is not incidental; it reflects both personal 
mental and sociocultural reality (Saparnis 2000). It 
is known from the history of social research that 
psychosemantic material (associative response of 

C
om

m
un

ic
at

io
n 

ef
fe

ct
iv

en
es

s 

Richness of communication channel 

Face-to-face 
communication 

Telephone 
communication Video recording 

Audio recording 

Paper commu-
nication 

E-mail conversation QQuueessttiioonn  --  aannsswweerr    
MMooddeelllliinngg  ooppttiioonnss  

NNoo  qquueessttiioonn  --  aannsswweerr  
DDooccuummeennttaattiioonn  ooppttiioonnss  

Video commu-
nication 



J. Bersenaite, G. Saparnis, D. Saparniene 

1028 

respondents to verbal stimuli) is a reliable empirical 
reference. Reference to analysis of psychosemantic 
structures enabled tangible achievements in differ-
ential psychology, psychodiagnostics, and social 
attitudes research (Osgood, 1959). In our research 
the role of a word – stimulus has been played by 
stimulating material compiled on the basis of lexical 
formations “typology of organisational changes”, 
“responsibility for changes”, and “communication 
of changes” and presented to employees of organi-
sations. 

The questionnaires having been returned, it 
turned out that the answers contain 880 statements 
reflecting the respondents’ opinions about typol-
ogy of organisational changes (283 indicators), 
responsibility for organisational changes (302 in-
dicators), and communication of these changes 
(295 indicators). Respondents replied to the ques-
tions in one to three sentences. While processing 
the research data a decision was made to choose a 
“strict system of variables” to enable application 
of quantitative method. Therefore categories were 
established by grouping empirically obtained an-
swers. 

4. Research results and discussion 

The research shows that a large part (19.8%) of the 
respondents thinks that nothing needs to be 
changed in their organisations, i.e., that status quo 
must be maintained (Table 1). Managerial wisdom 
holds that if a change obstructs achieving the aim, 
such a change must be rejected. It is assumed that 
the position of respondents willing to maintain 
status quo may have resulted from thinking that 
their organisation is doing well and changes are 
not needed. This is confirmed by statistical calcu-
lations showing that respondents willing not to 
change anything describe market situation of their 
organisation as positive. Analysis of certain socio-
demographic characteristics shows that young 
employees (younger than 25 years) with little work 
experience (up to 5 years) but in responsible posi-
tions (among them there are 3 directors, 5 deputy 
directors, 6 branch managers and 7 managers, but 
not a single owner of a company) are the least 
open to changes. 

Analysis of respondents’ answers to the open-
ended question on what needs to be changed at the 
organisation as well as to other questions shows 
that a part of respondents were unable to formulate 
their thoughts on what should be changed at their 
organisations (perhaps the question proved too 
difficult for the respondents). If we added respon-
dents who did not answer this question at all to 
those 6.1% who replied with “I do not know”, we 
would have 17.3% of all respondents. 

Table 1. Categories of what needs to be changed at 
the organisation for its aims to be achieved 
(N = 269) 

Organisational changes Frequency Percentage 
Management of human 

resources 63 24.0 

Systems and processes 55 21.0 
Culture 44 16.8 

Strategy 21 8.0 
Structure 6 2.3 

Complex changes 6 2.3 
Technologies 3 1.1 

 
Comparing the obtained empirical results to 

the organisational element changes described in 
scholarly literature on management it is seen that 
in practice there are more people inclined to 
change systems, organisational culture, and man-
agement of human resources. Only a small part of 
respondents pointed out the need to change organ-
isational structure. Change in organisational struc-
ture is the change most often mentioned by theore-
ticians. A rather low frequency of the need for 
changes in technologies as an element of an or-
ganisation shows that respondents do not relate 
these changes to prospective introduction of inno-
vations, abilities to compete in larger market and 
to increase productivity and efficiency, etc. By the 
way, a few respondents (2.3%) indicated that ac-
complishing of aims needs more than changes in 
separate organisational elements – comprehensive 
changes must take place. 

It has been noticed that, according to the re-
spondents, the biggest number of changes should be 
initiated in management of human resources. Some 
respondents are dissatisfied with employee plan-
ning, selection, and evaluation system (11.8%). 
Changes in the process of management of human 
resources are closely related both to employee mo-
tivation system (11.5%) and to managing personnel 
(10.3%). No significant difference in attitudes to 
change in management of human resources has 
been found. The need for changes in this area has 
been indicated by respondents regardless of their 
age or size of organisation they represent. However, 
there are slightly more respondents with long work 
and managerial experience who see some problems 
in personnel management. At all organisations (re-
gardless of their age and size) motivational mix 
should be reviewed or created. Moreover, replace-
ments of people in management might also contrib-
ute to positive organisational changes. 

Another type of organisational changes also 
frequently mentioned by the respondents is sys-
tem(s) changes. These are related to changes in 
work organisation system (8.0%), modification to 
marketing mix (6.1%), and changes in activity 
processes (3.8%) and quality management (3.4%). 
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16.8% of the respondents indicated organisa-
tional culture change as an important organisa-
tional change. It can be considered to be among 
the most complicated areas of change, because 
cultural changes (and behavioural changes) cannot 
be seen “with the naked eye” and their assessment 
is rather troublesome. The major part of the re-
spondents has at least minimum experience in 
managerial work and must be aware of the bottle-
necks of the organisation. This element of an or-
ganisation is most desired to be changed by young 
female employees with higher university education 
employed at medium organisations, the duration of 
operation of which does not exceed 20 years. 
However, people dissatisfied with work culture 
and conditions (2.3%) are mainly regular employ-
ees, they mentioned dissatisfactory work condi-
tions, tools, instruments, clothes, etc. 

Considering the attitude of employees to the 
necessity for organisational changes there emerge 
differences in respondents by their positions. Man-
agers put greater emphasis on the need for change 
of the current strategy or devising of a new one. 
Although devising or change of a strategy are the 
prerogatives of top managers of the organisation, 
the importance of changing it has also been indi-
cated by male employees who are still in or al-
ready with higher education, younger than 35 
years of age, with short work and managerial ex-
perience. In seeking the aims of the organisation it 
is important for managers to properly manage hu-
man resources (the problem area most often men-
tioned by managers), appropriately motivate them, 
and implement changes in organisational culture. 

Managers of 3 organisations were dissatisfied with 
quality management. Serving the function of su-
pervision they noticed that attention should be 
focused on ensuring the quality of prod-
ucts/services and all the processes. This is particu-
larly relevant to the objective of small and very 
small organisations to get established on the mar-
ket, to satisfy and retain customers. 

It has been noticed that employees with 
lower-level education emphasize changes in the 
mix of technologies, activity processes, work con-
ditions and culture, and motivational system more 
than other respondents do. This is explained by the 
fact that when performing their functions the for-
mer more often encounter production and techno-
logical resources, are more involved in the process 
of production and service provision in comparison 
to respondents with higher office. Employees who 
expressed dissatisfaction with work culture and 
conditions were mainly from small organisations. 
As to attitudes of employees, differences in atti-
tudes to systemic and comprehensive changes 
emerge. Attitudes of employees of medium or-
ganisations (that it is necessary to change activity 
management system and implement comprehen-
sive changes) differ from those of representatives 
of smaller or larger organisations. 

Pearson correlation coefficient was applied to 
determine relationships among categories identi-
fied during qualitative analysis. It must be noted 
that the respondents who put greater emphasis on 
necessity for changes in marketing mix more often 
mention that the motivation system needs to be 
changed as well (r = 0.135). 

 
Scale of cluster distances 

   
              0         5        10        15        20        25 
  Categories          +---------+---------+---------+---------+---------+ 
 
  STRUCTURE    -+---------------+ 
  TECHNOLOGIES    -+               +-------------------+ 
  STRATEGY    -----------------+                   +-------+ 
  CULTURE    -------------------------------------+       +---+ 
  SYSTEMS    ---------------------------------------------+   I 
  MANAGEMENT OF HUMAN RESOURCES -------------------------------------------------+ 
 
Fig.3. Cluster dendogram including changes in elements of organisation (N=269) 
 

Pursuant to the statistical data processing 
strategy chosen for this research, cluster analysis 
of created categories of changes relating to ele-
ments of an organisation was carried out, which 
enabled subsequent development of taxonomy of 
the categories. Figure 3 presents a dendogram ob-
tained by cluster analysis, wherein distances are 
measured by Euclidean distance. 

The greatest distance among 269 respondents, 
which puts all the organisational elements into one 

cluster, is 25 certain relative units of distance. It is 
the distance between two clusters of which one con-
tains a single category that exceeds all the others by 
frequency rating. It is the category reflecting the 
need for change in management of human re-
sources. The second cluster encompasses the re-
maining 5 categories. At the distance of 23 the large 
cluster is made of two clusters with 1 and 4 catego-
ries. 
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Table 2. Categories reflecting respondents’ attitudes to responsibility for changes and who notifies of changes 

Categories 

Responsible for 
changes Notifies of changes 

N = 301 N = 280 
N % N % 

Management personnel 250 83.3 234 83.9 
Executive personnel 33 11.0 15 5.4 
Founders and owners 26 8.6 10 3.6 

Subjects of external environment 16 5.3 3 1.1 
Responsible persons 11 3.7 14 5.0 

No-one 1 1.3 11 3.9 
 

Table 2 lists the categories reflecting respon-
dents’ attitudes to responsibility for changes and 
who notifies of changes. The data in the table 
shows that persons whom respondents usually 
hold responsible for changes are management and 
administration of organisations. By the way, man-
agement personnel are also associated with activ-
ity of a change agent when it is necessary to notify 
of the planned or ongoing changes in the organisa-
tion (or changes to the organisation itself). Re-
spondents’ attitudes to responsibility for changes 
vary rather insignificantly. People who tend to 
assign responsibility for changes to managers are 
employees of medium organisations who have no 
or little experience of managerial work. Mean-
while persons with little work experience but more 
educated see themselves as also responsible for 
changes. It must be noted that a part of respon-
dents consider various factors of external organisa-
tional environment to be not only catalysts of 
changes, but also responsible for changes. Young 
employees of small organisations operating in 
towns or villages think that responsibility for 
changes must be taken by somebody from outside: 
governmental institutions (municipalities, minis-
tries, or parliament). It has been noted that the 
larger an organisation, the more its members em-
phasize responsibility for changes lying with in-
ternal environment subjects (management and 
employees). 

Because managerial personnel of an organisa-
tion, according to the respondents, is largely re-
sponsible for changes, information about changes 
usually reaches employees from managers of dif-
ferent levels (director general, chief of production 
or commander of operations, machine shop man-
ager, team manager) as well. In rather rare cases, 
specialists (for example, an accountant or a law-
yer) or workers must notify of a change. Interest-
ingly, only 3 respondents pointed out they receive 
information about changes from subjects of exter-
nal environment. The categories of Responsible 
persons and Subjects of external environment re-
mained abstract, unspecified by the respondents. 
These categories are important as well, but impor-

tance assigned to them varies. It follows that at 
organisations different in size and activities re-
sponsibility for changes falls not on people hold-
ing specific office, but on various employees. It is 
interesting, what role in the process of change is 
played by founders and owners of organisations 
who, according to the respondents, rather rarely 
become providers of information. 

Respondents who find out about changes in 
progress from subjects of external environment 
pointed out that quality management needs to be 
changed (r = -0.238). Relationship among separate 
categories has been identified: the category of re-
sponsibility for changes falling on founders and 
owners is related to the category of founders and 
owners notify of changes (r = 0.491). The category 
of no-one is responsible for changes is related to the 
category of no-one notifies of changes (r = 0.296). 
The category of comprehensive changes are 
needed is linked to the following categories: re-
sponsibility for changes falling on founders and 
owners (r = 0.142); founders and owners notify of 
changes (r = 0.289); no-one notifies of changes (r 
= 0.220); no-one is responsible for changes (r = 
0.404). 

Most of the respondents pointed out they were 
provided with information about changes at meet-
ings, sittings, discussions, directly from manager (or 
other members of administration) speaking to a 
group – this is the category of “1 to group”. “Ver-
bal” (direct) is a rather abstract category reflecting 
type of communication about changes. The sur-
veyed employees named this method as “announces 
orally, informs directly” by usually relating it to the 
manager (particularly the immediate one). Although 
this method also includes communication “1 to 1” 
with a manager communicating to a subordinate in 
person, it was decided not to merge these separate 
categories in order not to lose authentic wordings of 
answers. As seen from Table 3, almost every third 
respondent who was able to point out the means of 
communication used during changes mentioned 
communication in writing, that is, information 
transferred via various documents, orders, emails, 
bulletins and announcements on boards, decisions 
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and letters received from ministries, or through a 
newsletter issued by the organisation. Some re-
spondents mentioned informal ways of communica-
tion as alternatives to official information about 

changes, saying that these contribute to spread of 
rumours and gossips. 

 

 
Table 3. Means of communication of changes (N = 92) 

Type of communica-
tion Titles of categories Frequency Percentage 

Formal 
Direct 

“1 to group” (meetings) 45 48.9 
Verbal 15 16.3 

“1 to 1” (in-person) 9 9.8 

Indirect Written 35 38.0 
Interactive 3 3.3 

Informal Informal 3 3.3 
Various means 2 2.2 

 
Analysing the respondents’ attitude to com-

munication during changes, it has been noticed 
that types of internal communication (channels 
used for transfer of information about changes) 
differ in small, medium, and large organisations. 
As it could be expected, employees of small and 
medium organisations reported that changes are 
usually communicated directly: a manager informs 
a subordinate verbally (in person). The larger the 
organisation, the more often are meetings or dis-
cussions during which the administration represen-
tatives announce the planned or ongoing organisa-
tional changes to a larger group of employees or 
even the whole staff. Written information on 
changes reaches employees most often at medium 
and large organisations where communicating in 
person is complicated and takes much time. More-
over, information presented in writing (particularly 
via e-mail) reaches employees of different divi-
sions faster and is less distorted by participants in 
the communication process. It was noticed that 
larger organisations use interactive tools (such as 
telephone or Skype) for communication of 
changes more often than smaller ones. Installation 
of modern information technologies at organisa-
tions opens wider possibilities not only to enrich 
the process of communication by new tools, but 
also to change the culture of information manage-
ment (together with the entire organisational cul-
ture), develop and improve human resources, 
competently manage processes and changes in 
general. At large, older organisations various in-
ternal communication channels are used more of-
ten, because such organisations have more finan-
cial resources to introduce various tools of 
communication. This is also necessitated by the 
need to inform the divisions (which sometimes are 
geographically remote). 

Two inverse relationships among different 
categories have been found: the category commu-
nicates 1 to group (direct communication) is in-

versely related to the category verbal communica-
tion (r = -0.432), while the category written com-
munication has inverse relationship to the category 
communicates 1 to group (r = -0.453). 

Furthermore, a direct relationship between 
different categories of questions has been found: 
the category work conditions need to be changed 
is related to the category changes are communi-
cated through various means (r = 0.570); the cate-
gory status quo should be maintained is related to 
the category changes are communicated in writing 
(r = 0.299); the category marketing mix should be 
changed is related to the category changes are 
learnt about informally (r = 0.390). 

5. Conclusions 

 It is universally known that the content of organ-
isational changes is rather broad. Analysis of sci-
entific literature shows that typology of organisa-
tional changes involves the following aspects: 
changes in management structure, organisational, 
employee, and management culture changes, stra-
tegic changes, changes in human resources man-
agement process, which are related to increase in 
labour productivity and efficiency, development of 
skills and competences, operational environment 
reformation changes related to introduction of new 
technologies to business processes, and systemic 
changes. 

Analysis of theoretical sources has led to con-
clusion that responsibility for organisational 
changes may be assumed not only by top or mid-
dle managers, but also by employee teams and 
independent advisers. Contributing to management 
of organisational changes, the latter may serve 
different roles in different contexts of changes. 
Scientists distinguish the following different mod-
els of responsibility of participants in changes: 
a) by model of leadership – top managers respon-
sible for identification and introduction of strategic 
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changes, b) by model of management – middle 
managers responsible for introduction or support 
of specific components of programmes or projects 
of strategic changes, c) by model of consulting – 
external or internal advisers who may be invited to 
work at any level; d) by model of teams – teams 
working on different levels of an organisation and 
assembled of necessary managers, employees, or 
advisers necessary to implement a specific change 
project delegated to them. 

Theoretical sources on communication of 
changes emphasize that the most efficient ways to 
stimulate and motivate or modify the current atti-
tudes within organisational changes is persuasive 
communication, information provision through 
various channels, face-to-face conversations, dis-
cussions, and observation. Purposefully using these 
means of communication the people initiating and 
implementing changes thus permanently provide 
information to employees on what behaviour is 
favourable to changes, what the possible outcomes 
of changes are, what the possibilities for participa-
tion are. Having identified employees’ expectations, 
likely support and resistance to changes they can 
successfully contribute to strengthening of readiness 
to support new initiatives of organisational changes. 

The research has revealed that organisation 
members’ attitudes towards typology of changes 
encompass all the elements of typology of changes, 
which are mentioned in theories of management. 
Comparing the obtained empirical results with 
changes in organisational elements which are de-
scribed in theories of management, it can be seen 
that practice knows more people willing to change 
human resources management (named by respon-
dents as the dimension in the greatest need for 
changes), systems, and organisational culture. Only 
a small part of the respondents replied that it is nec-
essary to change the organisational structure. Inci-
dentally, change in organisational structure is the 
change most frequently mentioned in theoretical 
sources. A rather low frequency of need for techno-
logical changes indicates that respondents do not 
relate these changes to prospective introduction of 
innovations, opportunities to compete on a larger 
market, increase productivity and efficiency. It is 
important that a few respondents pointed out that to 
achieve the aims of an organisation, changes in 
separate organisational elements are not enough: 
comprehensive changes must take place. 

Expressed opinion of the respondents is 
dominated by the attitude that people responsible 
for changes at an organisation are managers and 
those in administration. By the way, management 
personnel are also associated with activity of a 
change agent when it is necessary to notify of the 
planned or ongoing changes in the organisation. 

Respondents’ attitudes to responsibility for 
changes vary rather insignificantly. People who 
tend to assign responsibility for changes to manag-
ers are employees of medium organisations who 
have no or little experience of managerial work. 
Meanwhile persons with little work experience but 
more educated see themselves as also responsible 
for changes. 

Analysing empirical references of the respon-
dents regarding subjects communicating changes 
and communication channels they use, most re-
spondents pointed out that they are supplied with 
information about changes at meetings, sittings, 
discussions, directly by manager or other members 
of administration. Nearly every third respondent 
who was able to point out the means of communi-
cation used during changes mentioned communi-
cation in writing, that is, information transferred 
via various documents, orders, emails, bulletins 
and announcements on boards, decisions and let-
ters received from ministries, or through a news-
letter issued by the organisation. Some respon-
dents mentioned informal ways of communication 
as alternatives to official information about 
changes, usually saying that these are the sources 
of rumours and gossips.   
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